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2001235237 Starch branching enzyme 19 Jan 2005

2001248809 Novel insulin/IGF/relaxin family polypeptides and DNAs thereof 19 Jan 2005

2002216085 Self emulsifying lipid matrix (SELM) 19 Jan 2005

2002219322 Closed loop fluid-handing system for well drilling 19 Jan 2005

2002244899 Method for carrying out a biochemical protocol in continuous flow in a microreactor 19 Jan 2005

2002320118 Fortified ricebran food product and method for promoting cardiovascular health 19 Jan 2005

2002322358 HCV E1E2 vaccine compositions 19 Jan 2005

2003202961 Dental implant system 19 Jan 2005

2003210904 CYTOPROTECTIVE BENZOFURAN DERIVATIVES 19 Jan 2005

2003225217 Method and system for powder coating passage doors 19 Jan 2005

2003234495 Embossed tissue having loosened surface fibers and method for its production 19 Jan 2005

2003247229 Process for cleaning filters 19 Jan 2005

2003247398 SYSTEMS, DEVICES AND METHODS FOR OPENING A BOTTLE SEALED WITH
A STOPPER AND FOR SEALING A BOTTLE

19 Jan 2005

2003247815 A DEVICE HAVING A LIGHTABSORBING MASK A METHOD FOR
FABRICATING SAME

19 Jan 2005

2003257528 Gaming machine feature 19 Jan 2005

2003257870 Transport Block Size (TBS) Signaling Enhancement 19 Jan 2005

2003257880 Gaming machine with mine feature 19 Jan 2005

2003284678 Interleukin 6 production inhibitor 19 Jan 2005

2003907052 Turning complex fill stitching in embroidery designs 19 Jan 2005

2004101031 Container with Removable Portions Used as Reward Tokens 19 Jan 2005

2004202567 Refrigerating cycle apparatus 19 Jan 2005

2004208714 System and method for fast detection of specific on-air data rate 19 Jan 2005

2004210622 Fencing system 19 Jan 2005

2004216666 Instrument insert for a tool 19 Jan 2005

2004231264 Diaper for male pet 19 Jan 2005

2004233508 Vending Process 19 Jan 2005

2004235627 Retinal color prosthesis for color sight restoration 19 Jan 2005

2004235642 A High Pow Factor DC to DC Converter 19 Jan 2005

2004235662 High strength suture with absorbable core 19 Jan 2005

2004900050 Differentiation modulating agents and uses therefor 19 Jan 2005
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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